BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison County, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F: (601) 859-4743

DATE: May 13,2014
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammac
Emergency Management Office
RE: Road Claim
Shane Lang

Weisenberger Rd.

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the
Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of Shane Lang in
the amount of $525.32 (the lesser of the two attached quotes) for stated repairs. If any further
information is needed, please contact our office.

This is a problematic area and a reoccurring pothole.



ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT

In order to process claim, please print & fill out completely, then return to Madison County Road Dept. or
Madison Co. EMA office along with two signed estimates for damages being claimed.

Personal

Information

Date:
05/12/2014

Name: _Shane
Lang

Mailing Address:

105 Claiborne St. Madison Ms
39110

Contact #:
6018265520

Make/ Model of Vehicle: _ 2013 Nissan
Altima -

Incident

Information

Please answer questions below in relations to the incident being
reported:

Date: ___05/11/2014 Time: ___08;30
P.M.

Location: Gluckstadt Rd.

(name of road incident occurred)

Area Landmarks: Railroad Tracks near Airgas Plant
Approx. Speed at time of incident: 20 Mph
Direction of Travel: West

Cause of Incident:
_ Pothole

(ie: pothole, rock, etc..)

Area of vehicle damaged: Right Front Rim

Date Received:

OFFICE USE ONLY:

Received by: Dept:




Incident

Summary

Please write a brief summary of the incident (use back if needed):

Struck a pothole traveling West crossing over the tracks.

Date Received:

OFFICE USE ONLY:

Received by: Dept:
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Jackson, MS 39204
Phone: (601) 360-7490 - Fax: (601) 948-8602
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Nissan of Jackson, LLC
905 1-20 South Frontage

www.nobodybeatsacannondeal.com

TERMS: NET 10TH PROX,
ALL PARTS RETURNED MUST BE ACCOMPANIED BY THIS |NVOICE.
NO PARTS ACCEPTED FOR CHREDIT AFTER 15 DAYS.

ALL PARTS RETURNED MUST BE ACCOMPANIED BY THIS INVOICE AND WILL BE SUBJECT TO A 26% RESTOCKING CHARGE.
NO PARTS ACCEPTED FOR CREDIT AFTER 15 DAYS.

DATE ENTERED

YOUR GRDER NO.

DATE SHIPPED

INVOICE DATE

INVOICE
14 MAY 14 14 MAY 14 NUMBER Q1932
s **xx» TNV QL CE Q UOTE - DO NOT PAY *##x
0 ACCOUNT NO. Pl H PAGE 1 OF 1
L
D P
CASH .
0
ORDER_FILLED BY: JEREMY KREDS
SHIP VIA SLSM, B/L NO, TERMS F.O.B. POINT
603 B JACKSON, MS_
x%%% T NV OICE UOTE -| DO NOT| PAY **[x*

DISCLAIVIER OF WARRANTIES

ALL EXPRESSED WARRANTIES, IF ANY, BY A MANUFACTURER OR| PARTS 486.41
SUPPLIER ARE THEIRS, NOT THE DEALERS, UNLESS OTHERWISE[SURLET
PROVIDED IN WRITING AND FURNISHED TO THE BUYER BY THE FRETGHT 00
DEALER, MISSISSIPPI'S IMPLIED WARRANTY LAW MAY GIVE THE ] =
BUYER ADDITIONAL RIGHTS. SALES TAX )
STOMERS EIGNATURE
B‘: TOTAL . $525.32
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Jennifer Taylor

From: John Bell Crosby <johnbellcrosby@comcast.net>
Sent: Wednesday, May 14, 2014 9:55 AM

To: Jennifer Taylor

Subject: Re: Road claims

how much and what are the claims
1 saw this crater myself, so I’m inclined to pay
if this was fixed properly i don’t think such a crater would return

jbe

On May 13,2014, at 11:52 AM, Jennifer Taylor <Jennifer.Taylor@madison-co.com> wrote:

Good Morning!

I received two road claims yesterday on a pothole on Weisenberger Rd. (west side of RR tracks). This is
the same pothole that we paid all those claims on in November. This is a very deep hole that apparently
reoccurs after a heavy rain. | actually saw this hole yesterday morning on the drive to work and contacted
the road dept. to let them know and later that morning I received the two claims. The road dept. did go out
and fill the hole early yesterday morning.

I wanted to know how you wanted me to handle these claims. If we went by policy, it has been repaired, so
we are not liable, however it is a problematic area and we’ ve paid claims on it previously. Just looking for
your guidance on how you would like for me to process them.

_ennifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Wednesday, May 14, 2014 11:15 AM

To: 'Shirley Brown'; Helen Keller

Cc: Butch Hammack (bhammack@madison-co.com)
Subject: Weisenberger Pot hole

I have received two road claims on the pothole on Weisenberger Rd. as | emailed you about Monday. I am
aware that it was repaired Monday morning and thank you by the way. My question is... is there anything
that can be done differently to repair this hole since it is a constant problem, especially after a heavy rain. |
know we have paid almost 7,000.00 in claims on this one hole since November. I do not know the dynamics
of fixing a road by any means and that is why I am asking. Is this something that will continue to be a
constant problem or anything we can do for a permanent repair?

. Also, I need the labor sheet for the repair on this road Monday to put with my claims.
Thank you and just let me know what you think on this particular hole.

Have a good day!

Jennlifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
Emergency Management Office

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260



